Buyer:

Brenda Sensibaugh 6565 OF Opening Date: 07/08/21
NDOT
o Description Logan Contractors Supply Inc Maxwell Products Inc
p Description Qty | UOM Unit Price Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price
DIST 1 POLYMER MODIFIED
1 MELT ABLE BLOCK 44000 ( LB $0.495 $ 21,780.00| $ 0.464| $ 20,416.00
DIST 1 POLYMER MODIFIED . .
2 CARDBOARD BOX 44000 ( LB $0.455 $ 20,020.00| No Bid No Bid
DIST 2 POLYMER MODIFIED
3 |MELTABLE BLOCK 44000 ( LB $0.495 $ 21,780.00| $ 0.464| $ 20,416.00
DIST 2 POLYMER MODIFIED . .
4 CARDBOARD BOX 44000 | LB $0.455 $ 20,020.00| No Bid No Bid
DIST 3 POLYMER MODIFIED
5 MELTABLE BLOCK 44000 | LB $0.495 $ 21,780.00| $ 0.464| $ 20,416.00
DIST 3 POLYMER MODIFIED . .
6 CARDBOARD BOX 44000 | LB $0.455 $ 20,020.00| No Bid No Bid
DIST 4 POLYMER MODIFIED
7 MELTABLE BLOCK 44000 | LB $0.495 $ 21,780.00| $ 0.464| $ 20,416.00
DIST 4 POLYMER MODIFIED . .
8 CARDBOARD BOX 44000 | LB $0.455 $ 20,020.00| No Bid No Bid
DIST 5 POLYMER MODIFIED
9 MELTABLE BLOCK 44000 | LB $0.495 $ 21,780.00| $ 0.464| $ 20,416.00
DIST 5 POLYMER MODIFIED . .
10 CARDBOARD BOX 44000 ( LB $0.455 $ 20,020.00| No Bid No Bid
DIST 6 POLYMER MODIFIED
11 MELTABLE BLOCK 44000 | LB $0.495 $ 21,780.00| $ 0.464| $ 20,416.00
DIST 6 POLYMER MODIFIED . .
12 CARDBOARD BOX 44000 | LB $0.455 $ 20,020.00| No Bid No Bid
DIST 7 POLYMER MODIFIED
13 MELTABLE BLOCK 44000 | LB $0.495 $ 21,780.00| $ 0.464| $ 20,416.00
DIST 7 POLYMER MODIFIED . .
14 CARDBOARD BOX 44000 | LB $0.455 $ 20,020.00| No Bid No Bid
DIST 8 POLYMER MODIFIED
15 CARDBOARD BOX 44000 | LB $0.495 $ 21,780.00| $ 0.464| $ 20,416.00
DIST 8 POLYMER MODIFIED . .
16 CARDBOARD BOX 44000 | LB $0.455 $ 20,020.00| No Bid No Bid
Total $ 314,380.00 $ 163,328.00
Payment Terms Net 30 Days 0 30 Days
Delivery Days ARO 30
Comments
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